
Alexion OneSource™ CoPay Program Terms and Condi�ons 

The Alexion OneSource™ Copay Program (the “Program”) pays for eligible out-of-pocket medica�on and 
infusion costs, where applicable, associated with qualifying Alexion products (“Qualifying Products”). 
Eligible pa�ents may pay as litle as $0. Annual maximum program benefits may apply and may vary from 
pa�ent to pa�ent, depending on which eligible Alexion product is being used and the terms of a pa�ent’s 
prescrip�on drug plan. This is done to ensure that the funds are used for the benefit of the pa�ent, as 
based on factors determined solely by Alexion. Please contact OneSource™ at 1-888-765-4747 or via 
email at OneSource@alexion.com for the most up-to-date list of Qualifying Products. A�er reaching the 
maximum Program benefit, the pa�ent will be responsible for any remaining out-of-pocket costs 
incurred during that calendar year.  

The Program is valid ONLY for pa�ents with commercial insurance who have a valid prescrip�on for a US 
Food and Drug Administra�on–approved indica�on for a Qualifying Product. The Program is not valid for 
prescrip�ons covered by any federal, state, or government-funded healthcare program, including 
Medicaid, Medicare (including Medicare Part B and Medicare Part D), Medicare Advantage Plans, 
Medigap, Veterans Affairs, Department of Defense or TRICARE, or other federal or state programs 
(including any state prescrip�on drug assistance programs). Pa�ents residing in Massachusets or Rhode 
Island are eligible for assistance with medica�on costs, but are not eligible for assistance with infusion 
costs. No claim for reimbursement of any out-of-pocket expense amount covered by the Program may be 
submited to any third-party payer, whether public or private.   

To enroll in the Program, the pa�ent must also enroll in OneSource™, a personalized pa�ent support 
program offered by Alexion and must reside and receive treatment with a Qualifying Product in the 
United States or its territories. In addi�on, the person who is financially responsible for the pa�ent’s 
copay must be 18 years of age or older.   

Claims must be submited in a �mely manner. For billing provider-ini�ated claims, an explana�on of 
benefits, claim form or similar documenta�on from the pa�ent’s commercial health insurance must be 
submited within 365 days of the date of service for the pa�ent to receive out-of-pocket assistance. 
When the pa�ent is seeking direct reimbursement, proof of payment, an explana�on of benefits and a 
Copay Reimbursement Request form is required and must be submited within 365 days of the date of 
service for the pa�ent to receive out-of-pocket assistance. The Program will not pay for claims with a 
date of service that precedes the pa�ent’s enrollment in the Program by more than 90 days.  

Program par�cipants and providers are responsible, as applicable, for repor�ng receipt of the Program 
benefits to any insurer, health plan, or other third party who pays for or reimburses any part of the 
medica�on cost paid for by the Program, or as may otherwise be required by law.    

Program par�cipants are required to immediately inform OneSource™ if the pa�ent’s insurance changes 
or if the pa�ent is no longer eligible to receive Program benefits. If a pa�ent moves from commercial 
insurance to government-supported insurance during a calendar year, that pa�ent will no longer be 
eligible to receive Program benefits.    

This Program is not a health insurance or a benefit plan. The Program does not obligate the use of any 
specific medica�on or healthcare provider. This Program cannot be combined with any other rebate, 
coupon, free trial, or similar offer. Par�cipa�on in the Program is not condi�oned on any past, present, 



or future purchase. Program benefits may not be sold, purchased, traded, or offered for sale, purchase, 
or trade. The Program is not valid where prohibited by law, taxed, or otherwise restricted.  

In addi�on, Program par�cipants acknowledge and agree that their personal informa�on will be 
collected, used, and disclosed in accordance with the Alexion Privacy No�ce, available at 
htps://alexion.com/Legal#privacy, and the OneSource Enrollment and Authoriza�on Form, available at 
htps://alexiononesource.com which collec�vely provide informa�on about Alexion’s privacy prac�ces 
and the privacy rights that may be available to Program par�cipants. Program par�cipants authorize 
Alexion and its affiliates, business partners, employees, subcontractors, agents, designees, and other 
representa�ves to (i) use and share informa�on with their healthcare providers, specialty pharmacies, 
insurers and others for the purposes of coordina�ng enrollment and par�cipa�on in the Program; (ii) 
contact them by mail, telephone and/or email in connec�on with the Program; and (iii) inform them of 
available assistance programs, treatment and therapies and insurance-related informa�on.   

This is a voluntary program. Pa�ents may choose not to enroll in the Program and will s�ll receive 
medica�on. Pa�ents may par�cipate in OneSource without being a member of the Program. A�er 
enrolling in the Program, Program par�cipants may later opt out of the Program at any �me by 
contac�ng OneSource. By par�cipa�ng in the Program, Program par�cipants acknowledge that they 
understand and agree to comply with these Terms and Condi�ons. Alexion reserves the right to rescind, 
revoke, or amend the Program and these Terms and Condi�ons without no�ce. 
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